RESPONDENTS TO
Bid 17010
Ada County Sheriff’s Office 2017 Tahoe Equipment Purchase

Divisions awarded in red
All bids rejected in Division 3: Sound-Off Signal

Company | Bid Amount
1. HAVIS $9,737.92
2. Radiotronics or
Ray Allen $2,282.00
3. Sound-Off Signal $17,920.00
_ _ _ 4. Santa Cruz $3,273.40
Premier Vehicle Installation, Inc. 5 Whelan
' X ) $4,304.40
Engineering
6. NOVA by Ecco No Bid
7. Setina $16,232.25
8. Motorola $3,575.00
1. HAVIS No Bid
2. Radiotronics or .
Ray Allen No Bid
3. Sound-Off Signal No Bid
4, Santa Cruz No Bid
Gem State Communications, Inc. || 2 Whelan No Bid
Engineering
6. NOVA by Ecco No Bid
7. Setina No Bid
8. Motorola $3,056.40




HAVIS $9,510.95
Radiotronics or
Ray Allen $2,607.00
. Sound-Off Signal $18,480.00
. Santa Cruz $2,444.00
Territorial Supplies, Inc. . Whelan No Bid
Engineering
NOVA by Ecco $900.00
. Setina $15,457.84
Motorola No Bid
HAVIS $9,428.00
Radiotronics or Non-responsive
Ray Allen P
. Sound-Off Signal $18,980.00
. Santa Cruz Non-responsive
ERS, Emergency Responder ~ Whelan
Services, Inc. Engineering $3,230.00
NOVA by Ecco $1,310.00
. Setina $16,026.00
Motorola $3,900.00
HAVIS $8,961.53
Radiotronics or .
Ray Allen No Bid
. Sound-Off Signal $16,121.50
. Santa Cruz $2,864.20
Sirennet (MCLE Corp.) . Whelan $3 222.80
Engineering ’
NOVA by Ecco $980.00
. Setina $16,044.46
Motorola No Bid
HAVIS $10,688.00
o= | s
BO‘fse Mobile Equipment (BME ~ Sound-Off Signal $20,550.00
itting, LL ———
Upfitting, LLC) SantaCruz $2,800.00
. Whelan $3,530.00

Engineering




6. NOVA by Ecco No Bid
7. Setina No Bid
8. Motorola $3,290.00






