
 
 

RESPONDENTS TO  
Bid 15027 

Ada County Sheriff’s Office Tahoe Equipment Purchase 
 

Divisions awarded in red 
 

COMPANY BID AMOUNT 

Emergency Responder Services, Inc. 

Setina 
Division 

 $19,964.72  

Havis 
Division 

 $  7,793.15  

Plates for 
Havis 

 $  1,521.80  

Sound-Off 
Signal 

 $16,134.00  

Blac-rac  $     488.00  
Santa Cruz  $  3,430.00  
Motorola  $     865.00  
D&R  $  1,200.00  
ERS  $  3,780.00  
Nova  $  1,890.00  

 

Premier Vehicle Installation 

 
Setina 
Division 

 $20,064.84  

Havis 
Division 

 $  8,486.00  

Plates for 
Havis 

 $  1,457.40  

Sound-Off 
Signal 

 $13,861.65  

Blac-rac  $     369.00  
Santa Cruz  $  3,512.00  
Motorola  $     829.50  
D&R  $  1,725.00  
ERS  $  3,889.20  
Nova  $  1,976.40  

 



Sirennet.com 

Setina 
Division 

$23,346.40  

Havis 
Division 

$8,669.86  

Plates for 
Havis 

$1,443.15  

Sound-Off 
Signal 

 No Bid  

Blac-rac  No Bid  
Santa Cruz $3,230.40  
Motorola  No Bid  
D&R  No Bid  
ERS $3,776.40  
Nova $1,638.00  

 

Territorial Supplies, Inc. 

Setina 
Division 

$19,979.86  

Havis 
Division 

$8,458.75  

Plates for 
Havis 

$1,541.45  

Sound-Off 
Signal 

 No Bid  

Blac-rac  No Bid  
Santa Cruz $3,289.90  
Motorola  No Bid  
D&R  No Bid  
ERS  No Bid  
Nova $1,790.50  

 

Vehicle Lighting Solutions 

Setina 
Division 

 No Bid  

Havis 
Division 

$10,827.35  

Plates for 
Havis 

$618.15  

Sound-Off 
Signal 

 No Bid  

Blac-rac  No Bid  
Santa Cruz $3,868.82  
Motorola  No Bid  
D&R  No Bid  
ERS  No Bid  
Nova  No bid  

 

 




